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ichness of life at The IIS University extends far beyond 

Rthe classroom walls. Today, the University is recognized 
as a centre of excellence that nurtures intellectual and 

academic strivings, vibrant extra curricular activities, 
outreach initiatives and civic engagement. The students are 
encouraged to participate in a plethora of extra curricular 
activities which not only provide a large variety of avenues for 
self expression but also support them in developing a well 
rounded personality.

Research remains an integral aspect of growth which 
addresses real-world problems, informs our ethos and is an 
essential part of the University's pedagogical culture. This 
entire system is underpinned by a proactive faculty whose 
sustained and progressive contributions provide the much 
needed impetus towards excellence and innovation in all 
fields.

This booklet is an initiative by the University to acknowledge 
the achievements of our faculty and students. Due to paucity 
of space, the contributions catalogued here highlight only 
some of their accomplishments for the academic session 
2015-16. These are a mere tip of the iceberg and do not 
reflect the full range of their talent and the accolades and 
kudos won by them. 

STUDENTS’ ACHIEVEMENTS

Research and Academics 

q Ms. Rekha Sukhani (MBA-HR 

Sem. IV) received 11,000/- cash 

prize, First Position Certificate 

and a Gold Shield in National 

L e v e l  S u m m e r  P r o j e c t  

Presentat ion Competi t ion 

'Spardha 2015' organized by 

Institute of Rural Management, 

Jaipur from 20-21 November 

2015. 

q Ms. Nifeeya Singh (B.Sc. Sem. 

IV) bagged  Third Position in the 

Inter Collegiate Science Quiz 

Compe t i t i on  “Chemi s t r y  

O l ymp iad  (UMCCO -15 ) ”  

organized by Maharani 's  

College, Jaipur on 25 January 

2016.

q Ms. Shruti Jain (Research 

Scholar, Management Studies) 

received a Cash Reward of Rs. 

50, 000/- and was the First 

runner up in International 

Jewellery Design Awards 2015 

organized by   Jeweller's 

Association, Jaipur on 21 

August 2015.

q Ms. Shiromi Chaturvedi (B.Sc. 

Hons Sem. VI) stood Second in 

Essay Writing Competition 

organized by IHMR, in affiliation 

with WHO on 7 April 2015.

q Ms. Shweta Soni, Ms. Gunjan 

Khadria and Ms. Gunjan 

Sharma (B.Sc. Sem. V) won 

Third Pr ize in Bio Quiz 

(BioChrome 2015) organized by 

B.Lal Institute of Biotechnology, 

Jaipur from 15-17 October 

2015.

q Ms. Sushmita Aswal (Research 

Scholar, Microbiology) secured 

First Prize in Poster Presentation 

in BIOCON 2015, organized by 

Biyani Girls College, Jaipur on 

22 September 2015.

q Ms. Shruti Agarwal (Research 

Scholar, Biotechnology) received 

the “Madhya Pradesh Young 

Scientist Award” for the scientific 

contribution in the field of 

Environmental Sciences and 

won cash prize of Rs. 25000/-.

q Ms. Nandini Sharma and Ms. 

Noopur Bhargava (B.Sc. Sem. 

I V )  b a g g e d  t h e  “ B e s t  

Pe r f o r m a n c e ”  a w a r d  i n  

A m e r i c a n  S o c i e t y  f o r  

Microbiology Virtual Workshop 

on "Scientific Writing and 

Publishing" on 6 December, 

2015.

q Ms. Ruchi Middha (Research 

Scholar, Environmental Science)  

 • National winner in “Rio + 22 

UN Sustainable Energy for 

All India Program” organized 

by IARC Centre for United 

Nations.

 • Selected for the award of 
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ICSSR Doctoral Fellowship 

for the year 2015-2016.

q Ms. Shivani Panwar (BCA 

Sem. VI) secured Second 

Position in the Power point 

Presentation competition held at  

Maharani's College on 25 

January 2016. 

q Ms. Lakshita Goel (MBA IB 

Sem. II) secured Third Position in 

Extempore and represented The 

IIS University at Forest Training 

Institute on the occasion of 

Ozone Day Celebrations on 16 

September 2015. 

q Students of the Department of 

Economics, The IIS University 

participated in Economics Fest 

'SYNERGY' organized by St. 

Xavier's College on 12 and 13 

September, 2015. The IIS 

University was the overall 

w i n n e r  o u t  o f  t h e  1 8  

participating colleges from all 

over India. The awards won by 

the team IISU were:

 • The team comprising of Ms. 

Anukrit i  Gupta (BSc 

Honours, Sem V), Ms. 

S h u c h i  G u p t a  ( B A  

Honours, Sem V), Ms. 

Trupti Vashishtha (BA 

Honours, Sem V) and Ms. 

Sanskrit i  Rawat (BA 

Honours, Sem III) won first 

prize in KOOTNITI. They 

were also awarded with the 

cash prize of Rs. 3000/-.

 • The team comprising of Ms. 

Anukrit i  Gupta (BSc 

Honours, Sem V), Ms. 

Trupti Vashishtha (BA 

Honours, Sem V), Ms. 

P o o j a  M a t h u r  ( B A  

Honours, Sem V) and, Ms. 

C h e t a s h a  J a i n  ( B A  

Honours, Sem V) bagged 

second prize in ECONOMICS 

LIVE. 

 • The team comprising of 

Ms. Apoorva Devanshi 

(BA Honours, Sem V), 

Ms. Ayushi Saxena (BA 

Honours, Sem.II), Ms. 

K a w a l j o t  K a u r  ( B A  

Honours, Sem V) and, Ms. 

Vijaya Agarwal (BSc 

Honours, Sem III) won first 

prize in ECOTECTURE.

Co-Curricular Activities 

q The students of the University 

participated in Inter College 

Fest organized by B.Lal Institute 

of Biotechnology

 • Ms. Apeksha  Tickoo, stood 

First in Extempore.

 • Ms. Manika Sharma and 

Group stood First in Group 

Dance event.

 • Ms. Aastha Kalia and Ms. 

Arza Arora, stood First in T-

shirt Designing Contest. 

 • Ms. Aayushi Jain, Ms. 

Niharika Bansal and Ms. 

Anupma Agarwal stood 

first in “Best out of the Waste” 

contest. 

 • Ms. Shatakshi Agarwal & 

Ms. Harshita Kumari 

Rathore stood Third in T-shirt 

Designing Contest.

 • Ms. Nitika Khandelwal 

stood First in Rangoli and Ms. 

Purvai Modi and Ms. 

Rajika Parnami of BVA 

stood th i rd in F lower 

Arrangement Competition.  

q The Students of the University 

participated in 'ZEST- Inter 

College Fest organized by St. 

Xavier's College, Jaipur 

 • Ms. Apeksha Tickoo, (BJMC 

(Sem. IV) and Ms. Preksha 

Jain, (BJMC Sem. VI) 

received the “Best Team 

Award”.

 • Ms. Preksha Jain was 

adjudged the 'Best Speaker'.

 • Ms. Anushka Yadav (BA 

Hons Sem. II) secured 

Second Prize in Short Story 

Writing Competition.

 • Ms. Shivani Gera and 

Group bagged the First 

Position in Nukkad Natak. 

Shivani Gera also received 

the 'Best Actress Award'.

 • Ms. Neha Jain and Group 

stood First in Group Dance 

Competition.

 • Ms. Tanya Agarwal, (B.Sc. 

Hons Sem. I) won Second 

Prize in Salad Making 

Compet i t ion  a t  'ZEST '  

organized by St. Xavier's 

College, Jaipur from 17-19 

January 2016.

q The Theatrical Society of the 

University stood First in Stage 

Play Drama. Ms. Sakshi Singh 

was adjudged 'The Best Actress'.   

q The students of the University 

participated in the Inter 

College Fest organized by 

Biyani Girls College and won the 

following awards –

 • Ms. Dikshita Jalan, BJMC 

(Semester IV) and Ms. 

Apeksha Tickoo, (BJMC Sem. 

IV) bagged the 'Best Team 

Award'.

 • Ms. Aishwarya Naruka 

and Ms. Arza Arora stood 

First in Hand Painting 

Competition.

 • Ms. Jyoti Singh and Group 

stood First in Group Dance 

(Semi Classical Category).

 • Ms. Diksha Khatri & 

Group stood Second in 

Group Dance (Western 

Dance Category). 

q The Students of the University 
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participated in AQUAREGIA – 

Inter College Fest organized 

by Maharaja's College, Jaipur 

and won the following prizes : 

 • Ms. Dhriti Bumb and 

group received consolation 

prize in Group Song Event.

 • Ms. Anubha Khandelwal 

a n d  g r o u p  r e c e i v e d  

consolation prize in Nukkad 

Natak.

 • Ms. Ayushi Jain of Fine Arts 

secured Consolation prize in 

Face Painting.

 • Ms. Tanvi Vijay and group 

stood First in Group Dance 

(Folk Dance Category)

q Ms. Apeksha Tickoo stood First 

in Inter College Debate 

organized by Jaipur National 

University.

q Ms. Harshita Tewani stood 

Third in Debate organized by 

Stani Memorial College.

q Ms. Kanwal Shergil stood 

Second in the Debate organized 

by Stani Memorial College.

q Ms. Harshita Tewani was 

Runner up at VIT Debate, Jaipur.

q Ms. Ritika Bidawat and 

Group participated in Nukkad 

Natak in Kasturi – Inter College 

Fest organized by Kanoria PG 

College and won the First Prize. 

q Ms. Anshika Madnani and 

group participated in Nukkad 

Natak organized by LNMIT, 

Jaipur and stood Third. They 

also participated in Stage Play 

and won Second Prize. Anshika 

Gupta received the Best Actress 

Award.

q A  team of  33 s tudents  

participated in the All India 

Cultural Fest organized by 

IIT, Jodhpur from 26 to 28 

February 2016

 • The Performing Arts Club 

of The IIS University led by 

Ms. Manika Sharma won 

the flagship event 'Antarang' 

(Fashion Fiesta) and won 

sponsored gifts worth Rs. 2 

lac and Cash Prize of Rs. 

25,000/-.

 • Ms. Mousha Khatri was 

adjudged “Miss Antarang”.

 • Ms. Anshka Madnani and 

Ms. Shivani Gera stood 

S e c o n d  a n d  T h i r d  

respectively in Mono Acting 

Competition.

 • The team of Theatrical 

Society led by Ms. Shivani 

Gera stood second in 

N u k k a d  N a t a k .  T h e y  

received a cash Prize of Rs. 

10,000/ for the same.

 • Ms. Jyoti Singh won the 

C r e a t i v e  W r i t i n g  

Competition and a cash prize 

of Rs. 5,000/-.

q Ms. Shiromi Chaturvedi (B.Sc. 

(H) Sem. VI) and Ms. Preksha 

Jain (BJMC Sem. VI) won the All 

India Debate organized by J.K. 

Lakshmipat University, Jaipur. 

The winning team received a 

cash prize of Rs. 10,000/ for the 

same.  

q IIS Yuva Chaupal secured a 

Special Recognition Award for its 

various activities under the 

banner of CII Young Indians (Yi) 

for the session 2015-16 on 26 

February 2016.

Sports 
q The IIS University Tennis team 

(Ms. Purnima Nathawat, Ms. 

Meenal Maharwal and Ms. 

Pragati Dagga) secured 4th 

Position and qualified for All 

India Inter University Tennis (W) 

Tournament organized by KIIT, 

Bhubaneswar from 25-28 

December 2015.

q The IIS University Basketball 

Team (Ms. Vanika Jain, Ms. 

Manmeet Kaur, Ms. Kritika 

Khandelwal, Ms. Sonal 

Shekhawat, Ms. Anisha Dudi, 

Ms. Ritika, Ms. Chestha 

Choudhary, Ms. Nandani 

Rathore, Ms. Monika, Ms. 

Jagrut i  Chowdhry,  Ms.  

Archana Soni) secured 1st 

position and received a Cash 

Prize of Rs. 3000/- in 'Abhivarta-

16' in Annual Inter-College 

Sports Fest organized by 

Manipal University, Jaipur from 

12-14 February 2016 and won a 

Trophy in 'MST-16' in Annual 

Inter-College Sports Fest 

organized by Malviya National 

Institute of Technology (MNIT), 

Jaipur from 19-21 February 

2016.

q The IIS University Volleyball 

Team (Ms. Jaya Dwivedi, Ms. 

Nisha Chaturvedi ,  Ms.  

Mamta Chahar, Ms. Ekta 

Sharma,  Ms .  Nivedi ta  

R a t h o r e ,  M s .  K i r a n  

Choudhary, Ms. Mumal 

Kanwar,  Ms .  Deep ika  

Shekhawat, Ms. Nishtha 

Gupta, Ms. Shailja) secured 

2nd  pos i t i on  and  have  

collectively won a Trophy, 

Medals, Certificates and a Cash 

Prize of Rs. 2000/- in 'Abhivarta-

16' in Annual Inter-College 

Sports Fest organized by 

Manipal University, Jaipur from 

12-14 February 2016 and won a 

Trophy in 'MST-16' in Annual 

Inter-College Sports Fest 

organized by Malviya National 

Institute of Technology (MNIT), 

Jaipur from 19-21 February 

2016.

q Ms. Monika secured the 1st 

Position in 100 m event and 
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received a certificate and a 

medal in 'Abhivarta-16' in 

Annual Inter-College Sports Fest 

o r g a n i z e d  b y  M a n i p a l  

University, Jaipur from 12-14 

February 2016.

q Ms. Barkha Chauhan won 

Gold Medal in Air Rifle Junior 

and Senior Women Ranking in 

various Tournaments :

 • 2nd Position in Karni Singh 

Shooting Tournament, Ajmer 

from 15-20 August 2015

 • 5th Position in Gun for Glory 

Shooting Championship, 

Pune from 6-13 September 

2015.

 • 14th Rank in Rajasthan State 

Open Shooting Champ-

i o n s h i p  f r o m  2 1 - 2 4  

September 2015.

 • 2nd Position in Sports craft 

Shooting Championship, 

New Delhi from 12-19 

October 2015.

 • 35th Rank in North Zone 

Shooting Championship, 

New Delhi from 15-21 

November 2015.

q Ms. Sumita Rathore won Gold 

medal in 10 m Air Pistol in 

various Tournaments:

 • 9th Rank in All India 

Maharaja Dr. Karni Singh 

M e m o r i a l  S h o o t i n g  

Championship, Bikaner from 

12-19 October 2015.

 • 4th Rank in Rajasthan State 

O p e n  S h o o t i n g  

Championship from 21-24 

September 2015. 

q Ms. Sumita Rathore & Ms. 

Aishwarya   Shekhawat 

(Team Events) won silver medal 

in 10 m Air Pistol in 9th All India 

Maharaja Dr. Karni Singh 

M e m o r i a l  S h o o t i n g  

Championship, Jaipur.

q Rajasthan State Taekwondo 

Tournament was organized in 

Sawai Man Singh Stadium 

(SMS), Jaipur from 28-29 

September 2015. The following 

students secured position under 

various weight categories:

 • Ms. Tanya Verma won 

Silver medal (under 57 kg 

weight category).

 • Ms. Shivani Sharma won 

Silver medal (under 67 kg 

weight category).

 • Ms. Ambica Poonia won 

Bronze medal (under 62 kg 

weight category).

q Ms. Ambica Poonia and Ms. 

Trupti Vashishtha acted as 

Technical delegate in 11th TBI 

N a t i o n a l  T a e k w o n d o  

Tournament, Jaipur from 2-4 

October 2015.

NCC 
q Under Officer Swaranjali 

Saxena received cash prize of 

R s . 2 , 0 0 0  f o r  s p e c i a l  

achievements in NCC Unit and 

attended Advance Leadership 

Camp at Mallot, Punjab from 7 

to 20 September 2015 and 

attended SSB Course at Officer's 

Training Academy, Gwalior from 

16 November-25 November 

2015.

q Sgt. Anjali Sahrawat received 

cash prize of Rs.2,000 for her 

achievements in shooting for 

NCC and attended a Tracking 

Camp a t  Dar jee l ing  25 

November-6 December 2015.

q Cdt .  Barkha  Chauhan  

received cash prize of Rs,8,000 

for her achievements in 

shooting for NCC.

q Warrant Officer Richa Joshi 

was selected to represent India 

in Youth Exchange program in 

Vietnam from 16-27 September 

2015 and was the only girl cadet 

from Rajasthan Directorate.

q The IIS University cadets 

attended a Blood Donation 

Camp at 1 Raj Air SQN. NCC 

unit, Jaipur on 9 September 

2015. 

q Cdt. Millisa Singh attended All 

India Vayu Saink Camp in 

Airomodeling held at Jodhpur 

from 8-19 Oct 2015.

q Sgt.  Nidhi Shekhawat, 

Cdt.Momal Kanwar, Cdt.Kirti    

Nathawat, Cdt.Kajol Soni, 

Cdt. Meghna Pareek, Cdt. 

Versha and Cdt. Rachita 

Shekhawat attended Tracking 

Camp a t  Dar jee l ing  25 

November-6 December 2015.

q Cdt. Sakshi Sharma and Cdt. 

Deepika Shekhawat attended 

National Integration Camp at 

Motihari from 23 Nov -04 

December.

q Cdt. Barkha Kanwar Khichi 

attended Republic Day Camp 

2016, Delhi and represented   

Rajathan Directorate at Prime 

Minister's Rally on 28th January 

2016.

q Cdt. Garima Shekhawat of 1 

Raj Girl's Battalion, Jaipur 

attended Rock Climbing at 

Uttrakhand from 5 -12 Jan 

2016.

q Sgt. Pratibha Shekhawat 

attended Special National 

Integration Camp at Port Blair 

from 9-20 February and won 

Gold Medal in Comparing.

FACULTY ACHIEVEMENTS

Research and Academics
q Dr. Charu Sharma, Sr. Asst. 

Professor, Department of 

Biotechnology 

 • R e c e i v e d  t h e  “ B e s t  

Performance Award” in 

Amer i can  Soc i e t y  f o r  
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M i c r o b i o l o g y  V i r t u a l  

Workshop on "Scientific 

Writing and Publishing" on 6 

December, 2015.

q Dr. Payal Mehtani, Sr. Asst. 

Professor, Department of 

Biotechnology 

 • R e c e i v e d  t h e  “ B e s t  

Performance Award” in  

Amer i can  Soc i e t y  f o r  

M i c r o b i o l o g y  V i r t u a l  

Workshop on "Scientific 

Writing and Publishing" on 6 

December, 2015.

q Ms. Prachi Goswami, Asst. 

P r o f e s s o r  i n  G e r m a n  

( L a n g u a g e s  a n d  M a s s  

Communication)

 • Received scholarship by 

Gothe Institute Germany to 

attend 15 Days Teacher's 

Training Programme.

q Dr. Rimika Singhvi, Associate 

Prof., Dept. of Languages and 

Mass Communication (English)

 • P a p e r  s e l e c t e d  f o r  

presentation at the Annual 

World Congress of the 

International Comparative 

Literature Association (ICLA) 

at the University of Vienna, 

Austria, July 2016

q Dr. Smita Purohit, Sr. Assistant 

Professor, Botany

 • Presented a paper on 

“Optimization of Calcium 

Chloride for Efficient in vitro 

Regeneration in Cuminum 

cyminum L : A Significant 

Seed Spice”  at  2nd 

International Conference on 

Advances in Bioinformatics  

a n d  E n v i r o n m e n t a l  

Engineering - ICABEE, Rome 

from 18-19 April 2015.

q Ms. Alka Kataria, Part time 

Lecturer, Dept. of Environmental 

Science 

 • Presented a paper at  

International Geographical 

Un ion  ( IGU ) -Reg iona l  

Conference 2015  organized 

by Lomonosov Moscow State 

University, Moscow, Russia, 

17-21 August, 2015.

Books Authored/ 

Co-Authored/Edited/Reviewed
q Ms. Chanda Asani, Lecturer, 

Centre for Women's Studies 

 • Authored an e-book entitled” 

Representing the Invisible: A 

T r a v e l o g u e  M e r g i n g  

Identities and Borders” on 

l ink https://www.smash 

words.com/ books/view / 

574357.

q Dr. Aditi R. Khandelwal, Asst. 

Professor, Department of 

Business Studies 

 • Authored a book entitled 

“Retailing Management” 

published by RBSA, Jaipur 

(ISBN 978-81-7611-740-1).

q Dr. Mahesh Singh, Associate 

Professor, Department of Fine 

Arts  

 • Co-Authored A Book Entitled 

“Indian Art Part-I” Published 

By Board Of Secondary 

Education, Rajasthan, Ajmer.

q Dr. Mani Bhatia, Asst. Prof. 

Dept. of Accounting & Taxation 

 • Rev i ewed  a  book  on  

Corporate  Accounting 

published by Research 

Reinforcement in February  

2016 (ISBN 81-8142-029-

2).

q Dr. Vandana Sachdeva, Asst. 

Professor, Dept. of Management 

Studies 

 • Reviewed a book on Virtual 

Bank ing :  A  Gu ide  to  

Innovation and Partnering 

published by Research 

Reinforcement (ISBN ISBN-

13: 978-1118742471).

q Dr. Neha Baid, Asst. Professor,  

Department of Language and 

Mass Communication (Hindi) 

 • Edited and reviewed a book 

entitled Santkavi Hariramdas 

N i r a n j a n e e  P r n e e t  :  

Naamprakash published by 

Royal Publication, Jodhpur, 

First Edition 2015 (ISBN 978-

93-8211-42-3). 

q Dr. Ritu Jain, Associate 

Professor and Dr. Nidhi 

Bhargava ,  A s s o c i a t e  

Professor, Department of 

Physics 

 • Co-authored a book entitled 

“Optics” published by Jaipur 

Publishing House, Jaipur, 

(ISBN 978-81-8047-205-3). 

q Dr. Poonam Sethi, Part Time 

Lec turer,  Depar tment  o f  

L a n g u a g e  a n d  M a s s  

Communication 

 • Edited books two books 

entitled Kathya Sanchyan 

(ISBN  978-93-81149-83-6) 

and  Re k h a c h i t r a  a v m  

Sansmaran (ISBN  978-93-

81149-83-6). 

q Dr. Smita Purohit, Sr. Assistant 

Professor, Botany

 • Co-authored two books 

ent i t led “Pr inc ip les  of  

Genetics” (ISBN (13):978-

81-  7754-578-7)  and 

“Principles of Plant Breeding” 

(ISBN (13):978-81- 7754-

5 7 8 - 4 )  p u b l i s h e d  b y  

Agrobios (India).

Other Achievements
q Mr. Pankaj Kumar, Asst. 

Professor, Department of 

Biotechnology

 • Resource Person in  National 

Conference on Geographical 

Indications organized by 

Amity University, Rajasthan 

from 17-18 March 2015.

 • Resource Person in Workshop 
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on “Provision of Protection of 

Plant Varieties & Farmer's 

Rights Authority” organized 

b y  A m i t y  U n i v e r s i t y,  

Rajasthan on 27 May  2015.

 • Resource Person in Workshop 

on “Protection of R&D 

outcomes through IPR” 

organized by Uttarakhand 

State Council for S&T on 30 

October 2015.

 • R e p r e s e n t e d  T h e  I I S  

University in Symposium on 

“Intellectual Property Rights 

( I P R )  L e ve rag i ng  and  

Management” organized by 

Institute of Intellectual 

Property Research and 

Development, Greater Noida 

on 8 February, 2016

q Dr. Shilpi Rijhwani, Associate 

Professor, Department of Botany 

 • Resource Person in C3W – 

2015 at Suresh Gyan Vihar 

University on 17-18 October 

2015 . 

q Dr. Sreemoyee Chatterjee, 

Associate Professor, Department 

of Biotechnology  

 • Resource Person in C3W – 

2015 at Suresh Gyan Vihar 

University on 17-18 October 

2015.  

q Dr. Sharad Rathore, Professor, 

Dept. of History 

 • Delivered a Lecture on the 

“Significance of National 

A r c h i v e s  o f  I n d i a  i n  

Contemporary Times and in 

Historical Research” to the 

current RAS Batch Trainees in 

RICEM, Jaipur on the 125th 

Foundation Year Celebration 

of National Archives of India, 

Record Centre, Jaipur on 

10th March 2016.

q D r.  P r i y a n ka  M a t h u r,  

Associate Professor, Department 

of Zoology 

 • Invited as a Subject Expert for 

conducting the interviews for 

Zoology faculty applicants 

aspiring for IIT /AIPMT 

coaching institute at SKIT, 

Jagatpura on 8 March, 2016. 

q Dr. Smita Purohit, Sr. Assistant 

Professor, Botany

 • Invited as a Subject Expert for 

conducting the interviews for 

Botany faculty applicants 

aspiring for IIT /AIPMT 

coaching institute at SKIT, 

Jagatpura on 8 March, 2016. 

q Dr. Aditi R. Khandelwal, Asst. 

Professor, Department of 

Business Studies 

 • Received “Women Recog-

nition Award 2015” organ-

ized by 95 FM Radio Tadka. 

 • Successfully completed a 

c o u r s e  o n  " B u s i n e s s  

Correspondent and Business 

Facilitator", Certified by 

National Skill Development 

C o r p o r a t i o n  ( N S D C ) ,  

Government of Rajasthan.

q Dr. Mahesh Singh, Associate 

Professor, Department of Fine 

Arts  

 • Art Work Selected In The 7th 

K iwa Exh ib i t ion  2016 

O r g a n i z e d  B y  K y o t o  

International Woodprint 

Association, Japan to be held 

in March 2016. 

 • Actively participated in 

International Group Show at 

Alive Jincheon Printmaking 

Museum, Korea From 6th 

October To 1st November, 

2015.

 • Actively participated in 

National Print Making Camp 

2015  organized by Jawahar 

Kala Kendra, Jaipur from 9th  

to 13th  September, 2015.

q Ms. Anju Choudhary, Part Time 

Lecturer, Department of Fashion 

& Textile Technology 

 • Secured Second Position in 

Designing in Ju-Rhythm 

2015, organized by JECRC.  

q Dr. Shelja K. Juneja, Associate 

Professor & Mr. Ashish Tambi, 

Asst. Professor, Department of 

Environmental Science 

 • R e p r e s e n t e d  T h e  I I S  

University, Jaipur in the 

“ W o r k s h o p  o n  G I S ”  

organized by the Department 

of Information-Technology 

and Communica t ion  ,  

Government of Rajasthan 

and NIIT (Neemrana) on 5th 

F e b r u a r y  2 0 1 6  a t  

Conference Hall, Yojana 

Bhawan, Jaipur.

Recognitions 
In recognition of praiseworthy 

contribution in the field of 

Academics and Research for the 

session 2014-15, the following staff 

members were awarded the 

'Certificate of Appreciation' by 

the Research Promotion Committee 

of The IIS University, Jaipur.

Faculty of Arts and Social Sciences 

q Dr. Radha Kashyap, Professor  

q Dr. Roopa Mathur, Professor 

q Dr. Rimika Singhvi, Associate 

Professor

q Dr. Mahesh Singh, Associate 

Professor 

Faculty of Science

q Dr. Ila Joshi, Professor 

q Dr. Priyanka Mathur, Associate 

Professor   

q Dr. Sreemoyee Chatterjee, 

Associate Professor 

q Dr. Neha Batra, Asst. Professor 

q Dr. Ameeta Sharma, Sr. Asst. 

Professor 
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Faculty of Commerce &

Management

q Dr. Ruchi Jain, Sr. Asst. Professor 

q Dr. Aditi R. Khandelwal, Asst. 

Professor 

Ph.D Awarded 

q Dr. Astha Saxena, 

Department of Journalism and 

Mass Communication 

q Dr. Anubha Jain, Department 

of Computer Science & IT 

q Dr. Shveta Parnami, 

Department of Computer 

Science & IT 

q Dr. Kanupriya Rathore, 

Department of Visual Arts 

q Dr. Sonal Jain, Department of 

Library & Information Science 

q Dr. Purnima Sharma, 

Department of Management  

q Dr. Sucharita Sharma, 

Department of English 

q Dr. Vandana Sachdeva, 

Department of Management 

q Dr. Sanjoli Mobar, 

Department of Biotechnology

q Dr. Chanchal Sinha, 

Department of Home Science 

(Human Development)

q Dr. Aditi Bhardwaj, 

Department of English 

q Dr. Gargi Banerjee, Fine Arts 

(Performing Arts)

q Dr. Manisha Patni, 

Department of Chemistry  

q Ms. Kokila Chaturvedi, 

Department of Library & 

Information Science (M.Phil.)

Conferences/Seminars/Worksho

ps organized at The IIS University 

2015-16

q National Seminar on Women 

Empowerment and Inclusive 

Growth sponsored by Indian 

Council of Social Science and 

Research (ICSSR), New Delhi 

held on 13-14 March 2015 

organized by Centre for 

Research, Innovation and 

Training (CRIT).

q International Conference on 

M a r k e t i n g  ( I C M )  2 0 1 5  

Con tempora ry  Trends  &  

Challenges across the Globe 

held on 3-4 April 2015 

organized by Department of 

Commerce. 

q A  2-Week Workshop on 

Capacity  Building Programme 

on Research Methodology for 

Young Faculty in Social Sciences 

sponsored by ICSSR, held from 

21 May – 3 June 2015 organized 

by Centre for Research, 

Innovation and Training (CRIT).

q A 4-day Workshop on Teaching 

Methodology held from 5-8 

August 2015 was organized for 

The IIS University faculty 

members  by  Cent re  for  

Research, Innovation and 

Training (CRIT) and Internal 

Quality Assurance Cell (IQAC). 

q Nat ional  Conference on 

“ R e p r o d u c t i v e  H e a l t h  

Cha l l enges :  I s sue s  and  

Remedies” in collaboration with 

Indian Society for the Study of 

Reproduction & Fertility (ISSRF), 

Depar tment  o f  Zoo logy,  

University of Rajasthan and 

Mahatma Gandhi Institute of 

Medical Science and Research, 

Jaipur was held from 11-13 

September 2015, organized by 

Department of Zoology.

q National Conference on “Social 

Transformation and Media: 

Realities and Challenges” held 

o n  2 - 3  O c t o b e r  2 0 1 5 ,  

organized by Department of 

Sociology and Department of 

J o u r n a l i s m  &  M a s s  

Communication.

q Nat ional  Conference on 

“Sus ta inab le  Growth  o f  

Business:  Strategies and 

Challenges” held at The IIS 

University, Jaipur on 16-17 

October, 2015, organized by 

Department of Management 

(HRM&IB).

q Nat ional  Conference on 

“Prevention and Management 

o f  N o n  C o m m u n i c a b l e  

Diseases” held on 8-9 January 

2016 organized by Department 

of Home Science.

q International Conference on 

“ B i o t e c h n o l o g y  a n d  

Nanotechnology (ICBN-2016)” 

held on 31 January – 1 February 

2016, organized by Department 

of Biotechnology sponsored by 

Indian Science Congress 

Association, Jaipur Chapter and 

ICMR, New Delhi.

q ICSSR Sponsored National 

Conference on “Women, Health 

and Identity: Re-visioning a 

Multidisciplinary Perspective” 

held on 12-13 February 2016 

organized by Department of 

Psychology.

q Nat ional  Conference on 

“Corporate Governance : New 

Paradigms” on 4-5 March 2016 

organized by Department of 

Management Studies and 

Financial Studies, The IIS 

University, Jaipur. 

q One day Seminar on “Protection 

of Plant Varieties and Farmer's 

Right” on 10 March 2016 

sponsored by Protection of Plant 

Varieties and Farmer's Right 

Authority (PPVFRA), Ministry of 

Agriculture & Farmer's Welfare, 

Government of India, New 

Delhi. 
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